
 

                                                     

apartment-- a home in a large building 
 
 

 

 
http://www.presidio.gov/NR/rdonlyres/D720FCC2-E7AD-436E-9B07-

213267216A9B/3234/image002.jpg 

theater--a building where plays are 
performed or movies are shown 

 

http://stardust.jpl.nasa.gov/theater/newtheat.gif 



 

                                                     

post office-- a place to mail letters 
 
 

 

 
https://www.uspsoig.gov/blog/old-post-office 

 
freeway-- roads that cars use for fast 
travel  
 
 

 
www.iac.anl.gov 

 



 

                                                     

fire department-- a building where fire 
fighters stay with their fire trucks until 
they are called to help  
 

 
www.troyohio.gov 

 
golf course-- an area of land used for 
playing the game of golf 
 
 

 
https://safarigolf.columbuszoo.org/ 

 



 

                                                     

government office-- an office where 
people work for the government 
 
 

 
https://www.afcea.org/content/us-government-urgently-needs-address-cybersecurity-

challenges 

 
mail--to send letters  

 

 
https://www.onetoone.group/direct-mail-services.html 



 

                                                     

industries-- large companies that make 
things to sell 
 
 

 
www.dongnai-industry.gov.vn/ images/top3.jpg 

 
jail-- a locked place where people stay 
for a short time as punishment 
 
 
 

 
www.presidio.gov/.../ 0/injail21.jpg 

 



 

                                                     

landfill-- a place where trash and waste 
are stored 
 
 

  
https://www.stuffyoushouldknow.com/podcasts/how-landfills-work.htm 

library-- a place where books are kept 
and where people can read and borrow 
the books 
 

 
https://www.princeton.edu/academics/library 

 



 

                                                     

low income housing-- houses that can 
be bought or rented by people who do 
not have much money 
 

 
https://www.biggerpockets.com/blog/2016/06/15/low-income-rentals/ 

 
 
office complex-- buildings where people 
work  

 

 
https://lincolnequities.com/project/nj-office-portfolio/ 

 



 

                                                     

park-- an area with trees, grass, and 
playgrounds  
 
 

 
www.tempe.gov 

 
police department-- a building where 
police officers work 
 
 

 
https://www.townofclaytonnc.org/police/ 



 

                                                     

prison-- a locked place where people 
must stay for a long time as punishment 
 

 

 
https://www.chron.com/news/houston-texas/article/Texas-prison-system-slashes-price-of-

inmate-phone-13180653.php 

shopping center-- a large building 
where people can shop  
 
 

 
https://www.hekserij.net/how-to-find-the-best-shopping-center-in-englewood/ 

 



 

                                                     

strip mall-- a group of stores that share 
a parking lot. 
 

 
https://www.calvacpaving.com/how-many-parking-spots-will-i-need-for-my-strip-mall/ 

 
shop--to buy things 

 

 
 

https://www.southbankcentre.co.uk/visit/shopping/hayward-gallery-shop 

 
 
 

 
 



 

                                                     

urban planner--a person who is trained 
to design cities 

 

 
 

 
 

geographer--a person who studies the 
Earth 

 

 
 
 
 

 


